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Lake Land College
Facilities Planning

5001 Lake Land Boulevard, Mattoon, Illinois 61938

Anatomical Models
Project No. 11003

BID DATE: March 3, 2007 - 2:00 PM
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Carolina Biological S ly Co.
'ina Blological supply 1,091.55 | 2,736.00 | 3,705.00 | 68875 | 1,458.00 | 1,733.75 | 1,895.25 | No Bid
Burlington, NC
Woards Natural Science
urat et 777.64 | 3,044.00 | 2,124.00 | 487.00 | 1,203.00 | 1,312.00 | 1,463.00 | 1,538.00
Rochester, NY
Nebraska Scientifi
ebraska Scientitic No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Omaha, Nebraska
Sargent-Welch
8 No Bid 1216.68 |\, Bid NoBid | 1,032.30 | 1,665.10 | 1,799.10 | No Bid

Arlington Heights, Illinois
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